Winc}\e_ster
/ City Council

FOI REF: 16385

RESPONSE SENT: 22/12/2025

Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please provide the following information
relating to Council Tax liabilities for the financial year 2024/25.

For clarity: this request refers to all Council Tax accounts where liability fell within the
period 1 April 2024 to 31 March 2025, regardless of when the bill was issued.

Please include all accounts where liability covered the whole financial year or any part
of the financial year, including part-year tenancies and mid-year changes of liability.

1. Council Tax enforcement actions

a. Number of summonses issued for non-payment of council tax b. Number of Liability
Orders granted by magistrates for non-payment of council tax c. Number of cases
referred to enforcement agents (bailiffs) d. Number of enforcement letters issued by
enforcement agents on behalf of the council e. Number of enforcement visits made by
enforcement agents on behalf of the council

2. Fees and charges

a) The summons fee charged
b) The Liability Order fee charged
c) Abreakdown of how these fees are calculated or determined

3. Enforcement agent firms used

a) The names of all enforcement agent companies used by the council for council
tax collection, recovery, and enforcement during 2024/25

(Please note: | am requesting only the names of the enforcement firms, not contract
values or commercially sensitive information.)

4. Households in receipt of Council Tax Reduction (CTR) a. Number of cases referred to
enforcement agents where the household was in receipt of CTR b. Number of Liability
Orders granted where the household was in receipt of CTR c. For Liability Orders
involving households on CTR, a split by:

Working-age households
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Pension-age households

5. Attachment of Benefits and Attachment of Earnings a. Number of Attachment of
Benefits (AoB) requests sent to DWP (e.g., UC or legacy benefits) b. Total value of the
debt included in AoB requests (regardless of deductions taken) c. Number of
Attachment of Earnings Orders (AoEOs) issued d. Total value of the debt included in
AoEOs e. Number of households subject to ACEOs who were in receipt of CTR

Response

Please find the information you requested below in in appendix 1. Kindly note that | am unable
to provide overall data broken down by each financial year. However, the data below reflects
activity that occurred during the financial year 2024/25.

1. Council Tax Enforcement Notices
a. Summons 5965
b. Liability Orders 2075
c. Referrals to enforcement agents 2140
d. We do not hold this information.
e. We do not hold this information.
2. Fees and Charges — please see attached cost calculation.
3. Marston (Holdings) Ltd & Bukes Bailiffs Ltd
4. Households in receipt of CTR
We do not record this information and | am unable to produce this information retrospectively.
5. Attachment of Benefits & Attachment of Earnings
a. 221
b. £119,103.90
c. 19
d. We do not record this information and | am unable to produce this information
retrospectively.

We do not record this information and | am unable to produce this information retrospectively.
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