
 
 
 

 
 

FOI REF: 15163 
RESPONSE SENT: 10/02/2025 

 
 
Request 
 
I would like to request:  

1. The current list of approved suppliers of temporary accommodation that the 
council will use to procure from.  

If the council does not hold a list of approved suppliers, I would like to request:  

2. The full list of suppliers of temporary accommodation that was procured from in 
the financial year 2023-24. If data for 2023-24 is not yet available, then this 
should be provided for 2022-23.  

If the council uses contractors to manage their own stock of temporary 
accommodation I would like to request:  

3. The current list of approved contractors used to manage temporary 
accommodation that the council will use to procure from.  

If the council do not hold a list of approved contractors, I would like to request:  

4. The full list of contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that was 
procured from in the financial year 2023-24.  

If data for 2023-24 is not yet available, then this should be provided for 2022-
23.  

For suppliers of temporary accommodation, I would like to request:  

5. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spends with each supplier.  
6. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spends with each supplier.  
7. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spends with each supplier. 

If data is not available for 2023/24 then I would request the most recent three 
years when data is available.  

For contractors who are used to manage the council’s own supply of temporary 
accommodation, I would like to request:  

8. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spends with each contractor. 
9. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spends with each contractor.  
10. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spends with each contractor. 

 

 If data is not available for 2023/24 then I would request the most recent three 
years when data is available.  



  

 
 

If your organisation does not hold the specific information described at any 
question, I respectfully request that you provide any information it does hold from 
which these figures may be calculated. This could include any one database, 
spreadsheet or word document holding data relating to payments to suppliers of 
temporary accommodation for the last three years. Please share this excluding 
any information which could be considered personal information under the Data 
Protection Act. 

Data should, if possible, be presented in an itemised table either in Word or Excel. 

 

 
Response 
 

1.  The council do not currently hold a list of approved suppliers for 
temporary accommodation. 

 
2. The full list of suppliers of temporary accommodation that was procured 

from in the financial year 2023-24. 
 
Travelodge 
Premier Inn 
Holiday Inn 
Days Inn 
The Ambassador hotel 
 

3. The current list of approved contractors used to manage temporary 
accommodation that the council will use to procure from.  
 
The council own and manage its’ own stock of temporary accommodation in-house 
and do not use contractors to carry out this function.  
 

4. The full list of contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that 
was procured from in the financial year 2023-24. 
 

As above 
 

5. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spends with each supplier.  
Travelodge - £20,211.76 
Days Inn - £99.00 
Holiday Inn - £400.00 
Premier Innn - £72.00 
The Ambassador Hotel - £322.65 
 

6. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spends with each supplier.  
Travelodge - £19,792.63 
Days Inn - £796.00 



  

 
 

Premier Inn - £490.95 
Meon Valley Hotel - £42.00 
Mercure Hotels - £130.00 

7. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spends with each supplier. 
Travelodge - £5,125.83 
Premier Inn - £650.00 
Meon Valley Hotel - £42.00 
Mercure Hotels - £130.00 

 
8. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spends with each contractor. 
N/a 
9. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spends with each contractor.  
N/a 
11. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spends with each contractor. 
N/a 
 

 


