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SGS2R2\
100005

5th Winchester 
Scout Group

The funding will go towards a more community cohesive and acessible 
facilitity. Enhancing the acessibility for disabled individuals with an 
acessible toliet facilities will increase the inclusiveness of the 
Winchester Scout Group. The hall used by the Scout Group is widely 
used by a range of groups with varying needs. The group ranges from 
age 6-14 years. The club hope to increase the popularity of the group 
with the benefits of upgrading the current facilities. 

BadgerFarmOliversBatt
ery £500.00 £400.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%

SGS2R2\
100007

Helping Hooves 
UK Ltd

The funding will go towards wellbeing sessions for Carers of individuals 
recovering from ilness or injury.  The welfare of the carers is ensured 
throughout the duration of their care duties. The purpose of the 
sessions is to promote self care and a sense of whole wellbeing. 
Helping Hooves sessions take a hollistic approach to health and 
wellbeing. With activities such as aromtherapy, which is proven to 
reduce stress. It is evident that Helping Hooves offers a rounded and 
cohesive responsibility to the local community. UpperMeonValley £450.00 £400.00

Active communities, 
Prosperous economy 2 priorities = 90%

SGS2R2\
100009

Droxford Parish 
Council

Droxford Parish Council is a non-profit organisation. The Parish have 
identified a need to improve both their sport equiptment and recreation 
facilties, including; an outside table tennis table. The use of a table 
tennis table is said to promote the maintance of health and is particually 
popular with local residents. There is a population of 671 people likely 
to use the facilities. CentralMeonValley £500.00 £400.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%

SGS2R2\
100021

West Meon 
Village Hall

We would like to renovate the kitchen which are out of date and in poor 
condition.  This would enable greater community gatherings such as the 
Theater group to host, Scouts, WI to use and enjoy these facilities more 
fully.  We are finding that our kitchen fall short of other surrounding 
village halls such as Meonstoke, Warnford and Bishops Sutton.  We 
need new kitchen units and new electrics.  We have already fund raised 
for a new four hob range cooker which we are delighted with but now 
need a new kitchen. UpperMeonValley £500.00 £350.00 Active communities

Active communities 
= 70%

SGS2R2\
100024 Badger Press

We require funding to purchase specialist printmaking blankets for the 
Badger Press studio’s etching press.  The funding will allow us to 
purchase two blanket ‘types’. Firstly a rubber ‘litho’ blanket which we will 
combine with a foam backing for use in printing large scale relief prints. 
Secondly a set of professional/ artist’s quality felt blankets BishopsWaltham £494.00 £395.00 Properous economy 1 priority = 80%
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SGS2R2\
100028

Rainbow 
Playgroup

Rainbow playgroup want to provide stimulating and exciting outdoor 
play and learning opportunities for our children via a new off-site activity 
(not currently available in the village) that gives our children a weekly 
Forest School experience by purchasing the knowledge and support of 
Kindling Forest School (ie.  bush-craft, fire-lighting, den building, tree-
climbing, tool use, rope-work).  The children will gain all Forest School 
attributed benefits:- team-building,  independence, confidence, respect 
& understanding of natural spaces, increased physical health, self-
esteem, emotional and mental well-being, develop enterprising 
behaviours, creative ideas, imagination, learn to assess risks and 
problem solve.  ColdenCommonTwyford £500.00 £450.00

Active communities, 
Prosperous economy 2 priorities = 90%

SGS2R2\
100030

The Colden 
Common Shed

The colden common shed have a number of projects where  they need 
to cut pieces of wood accurately so that the components fit together 
properly. The sort of projects include the manufacture of hedgehog and 
owl boxes. We have also been approached by the cubs to assist with 
their DIY badges. For this we would create a kit of wooden parts so that 
they can nail, screw and glue the pieces together with a limited amount 
of sawing. A precision bandsaw would enable us to cut the component 
pieces of wood with the required degree of accuracy, so that we can 
create quality products for the community. ColdenCommonTwyford £499.99 £400.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%

SGS2R2\
100032

Twyford Parish 
hall

Twyford Parish Hall require funding to complete a project to create a 
sculpture/community focal point in front of the parish hall  from the trunk 
of a tree that has recently been felled.  A member of the village has 
donated significant time and materials to carve an iconic sculpture from 
the trunk.  Funds are now required for some materials to complete the 
project and preserve the timber. ColdenCommonTwyford £200.00 £200.00 High quality environment

Full amount 
awarded as under 
£250

SGS2R2\
100013

Friends of 
Lanterns

To sustain and develop the Welcome Breastfeeding Scheme. Friends 
of Lanterns promote the health and wellbeing of familes. The Friends of 
Lanterns provide a quality and well needed service to mothers. The 
rights of mothers and their children are understood and promoted. The 
Friends of Lanterns aid mothers to gain confidence. StBarnabas £493.00 £390.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%

SGS2R2\
100017

Itchen Valley 
Shooting Club

Lightweight target rifle, suitable for use by young persons, on our indoor 
range in Winchester. Itchen Valley Shooting Club is a widely used 
organisation that provides both a fun and social activity. The clubs 
members range from 8 years old to 80. In addition to a wide diversity of 
individuals. The sport promotes disicpline for young people. The Itchen 
Valley Shooting Club would benefit from a more manageable riffle for 
newer and younger members. StBartholomew £419.00 £330.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%



Small Grants Round 2
October 2016

ReferenceName Project Ward Request
Grant 
recommended

Community strategy 
priorities

Rationale for 
recommendation

SGS2R2\
100018 Winchester Hub

The funding will go towards gardening equipment that will allow the 
Give It a Go project at Winchester Hub, the student volunteering charity, 
to operate bigger and better community clean ups and get stuck into a 
wider array of projects that currently they are unable to, due to lack of 
resources. For example, it would allow them to build a project with 
Stanmore Primary School .  They are also planning to run a community 
action day in February which would benefit Stanmore residents 
renovating areas of individual housing schemes throughout the 
community. StLuke £463.00 £370.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%

SGS2R2\
100031

7th Winchester 
Scouts

The 7th Winchester Scouts began in 2013 and has since grown, 
becoming a fully independent  group last year.  Since starting, the group 
has developed and grown with September marking the start of a new 
group of 12 Scouts. The Scouts will be building on their camping 
experiences in Beavers and Cubs by going on more independent 
expeditions and hikes, carrying their own equipment.  This fosters a 
love of and respect for the natural world and preserving the natural 
environment, exercise and fitness as well as building skills in teamwork 
and leadership.  These Scouts require smaller tents which they can 
carry on expeditions and hikes. StMichael £500.00 £400.00 Active communities 1 priority = 80%

SGS2R2\
100010

Revitalise 
Respite Holidays

The charity is based in London. The project aims to help on individual 
and their carer in the Wibnchester disrict. One-week respite break for a 
disabled guest and their carer(s) from Winchester. Respite is essestial 
for any carer in order to continue a consistent level of high standard 
care. Having sufficent rest and a whole sense of wellbeing aids in the 
stability of carers ability to continue to care to the best of their abilities. 
Those whom take respite have reported an overall improvement in their 
self esteems and independance. The overall purpose of Revitalise is to 
leave a lasting yet simple experiance for carers. StLuke £354.00 £0.00 Not eligible

SGS2R2\
100002

Denmead Infant 
School PTA Scooter rack for the school children to use Denmead £500.00 £0.00 Not eligible
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